
Invitation to Bid #17-16, Site Furnishings 
Bid Tabulation

Item Description

Estimated

3-Year Term

Quantities

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Chingqing Arlua Civic 

Equipment 

Manufacturing

CHINA

Price

Per

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Fairweather Site 

Furnishings

Price

Per

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Paris Site 

Furnishings

CANADA

Price

Per

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Prison Rehabilitative 

Industries & 

Diversified Enterprises, 

Inc.

Price

Per

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

SBD Commercial 

Interiors

Price

Per

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Wesnic, Inc.
Price

Per

1 Standard Picnic Table 60 10 979.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 20 2,707.00$                  EA 10 4,101.64$                       EA 5 5,349.00$                  EA 1 3,873.50$                  EA

2 ADA Accessible Picnic Table 15 10 930.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 5 2,642.00$                  EA 10 3,764.09$                       EA 5 5,129.00$                  EA 1 3,619.50$                  EA

3 Arch Bike Rack 50 10 107.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 16 232.00$                     EA 10 241.87$                          EA 10 549.00$                     EA 1 525.85$                     EA

4 Drink Rail 30 10 550.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 10 1,092.00$                  EA 10 1,670.02$                       EA 5 2,499.00$                  EA 1 2,742.00$                  EA

5 Backless Bench 206 10 406.00$                          EA 10 1,579.60$                  EA 68 1,122.00$                  EA 10 1,607.44$                       EA 25 2,499.00$                  EA 1 2,825.75$                  EA

6 Bench with Back 15 10 735.00$                          EA 5 2,343.00$                  EA 5 1,787.00$                  EA 10 2,333.95$                       EA 5 4,049.00$                  EA 1 4,915.00$                  EA

7 Trash Receptacle 330 10 533.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 110 962.00$                     EA 10 1,482.43$                       EA 25 3,159.00$                  EA 1 1,587.50$                  EA

8 Removable Bollard 20 10 179.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 6 442.00$                     EA - No Bid - 5 1,249.00$                  EA 1 420.00$                     EA

9 Non-Removable Bollard 40 10 133.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 13 372.00$                     EA - No Bid - 5 989.00$                     EA 1 420.00$                     EA

10 Square Three-Seat Picnic Table 11 10 910.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 4 2,382.00$                  EA 10 3,279.29$                       EA 5 6,059.00$                  EA 1 4,820.00$                  EA

11 High Top Table 15 10 318.00$                          EA No Bid -$                            - 5 1,097.00$                  EA 10 1,592.96$                       EA 5 3,129.00$                  EA 1 2,222.50$                  EA

No intent to award has been issued.  Bids continue to be evaluated. 
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