
Invitation to Bid #56-16, Police Clothing and Equipment

Bid Tabulation

Description Brand Style # Qty Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size

MENS UNIFORMS

TexTrop2 Mens Long Sleeve Navy Shirts Elbeco Z314N 2 44.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 43.80$         All No Bid - No Bid - 40.50$         14-½ - 20

Navy Clip On Tie, Navy, Varied Lengths

Samuel 

Broome 90028 1 5.99$           - No Bid - 3.00$           - No Bid - No Bid - 4.99$           -

Navy Clip On Tie, Navy, Varied Lengths

Samuel 

Broome 90016 1 5.99$           - No Bid - 3.00$           - No Bid - No Bid - 4.99$           -

Navy Clip On Tie, Navy, Varied Lengths

Samuel 

Broome 90049 1 5.99$           - No Bid - 3.00$           - No Bid - No Bid - 4.99$           -

8 Pt Polyester Duty Cap (color: Navy)

Midway Cap 

Co. not available 1 53.99$         - No Bid - 30.67$         - No Bid - No Bid - 69.99$         -

8 Pt Rain Hat Cover for 8 pt hat w/visor Neve's P9014 1 N/A - No Bid - 3.00$           All No Bid - No Bid - 6.99$           -

TexTrop2 Mens Short Sleeve Navy Shirts Elbeco Z3314N 5 40.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 41.80$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         14-½ - 20

TexTrop2 Mens Pants, 4-pocket, covert stretch 

waistband, nano moisture wicking in Navy Blue (with 

light blue stripe) Elbeco E314RN 5 52.99$         28-42 No Bid - 31.13$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         28-54

WOMENS UNIFORMS

TexTrop2 Womens Long Sleeve Navy Shirts Elbeco Z9314LCN 2 42.99$         28-46 No Bid - 44.54$         All No Bid - No Bid - 40.50$         28-46

TexTrop2 Womens Short Sleeve Navy Shirts Elbeco Z9814 5 40.99$         28-46 No Bid - 40.07$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         28-46

TexTrop2 Womens Pants, 4-pocket, ladies choice fit 

waistband, nano moisture wicking in Navy Blue (with 

light blue stripe) Elbeco E9314LC 5 52.99$         2-18 No Bid - 32.34$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         2-24

UNISEX

Moisture Wicking Polo Shirt Short Sleeve- Vapor Pique PoloMocean 383473 5 57.99$         Officers No Bid - 46.33$         All No Bid - No Bid - 55.99$         S-2X

Men’s Stretch Tactical Pants Propper F52522y 5 43.99$         30-56 No Bid - 35.88$         All No Bid - No Bid - 47.35$         30-54

OTHER CLOTHING

TexTrop2 Mens Long Sleeve White Shirts Elbeco Z310N 1 43.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 43.80$         All No Bid - No Bid - 40.50$         14-½ - 20

TexTrop2 Mens Long Sleeve Lt Blue Shirts Elbeco 313N 1 40.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 43.80$         All No Bid - No Bid - 46.50$         14-½ - 17-½

TexTrop2 Womens Long Sleeve White Shirts Elbeco 9310LCN 1 40.99$         28-46 No Bid - 46.60$         All No Bid - No Bid - 40.50$         28-46

TexTrop2 Womens Long Sleeve Lt Blue Shirts Elbeco 9313LCN 1 40.99$         28-46 No Bid - 44.54$         All No Bid - No Bid - 46.50$         28-42

TexTrop2 Mens Short Sleeve White Shirts Elbeco Z3310N 1 39.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 41.81$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         14-½ - 20

TexTrop2 Mens Short Sleeve Lt Blue Shirts Elbeco Z3313N 1 39.99$         14.5-18 No Bid - 41.81$         All No Bid - No Bid - 39.99$         14½ - 17-½

TexTrop2 Womens Short Sleeve White Shirts Elbeco 9810LCN 1 37.99$         28-46 No Bid - 40.07$         All No Bid - No Bid - 36.50$         28-46

TexTrop2 Womens Short Sleeve Lt Blue Shirts Elbeco 9813LCN 1 37.99$         28-46 No Bid - 40.07$         All No Bid - No Bid - 39.99$         14-½ - 17-½

Mens Navy Cargo Pants Tact Squad 17004DN 1 42.99$         28-44 No Bid - 27.79$         All No Bid - No Bid - 42.85$         28-42

Mens Navy Cargo Shorts Tact Squad 17004DN 1 42.99$         28-44 No Bid - NO BID No Bid - No Bid - 42.85$         28-42

Navy Windbreaker-100% nylon, flannel lined Tact Squad 111N 1 22.99$         Sm-3XLg No Bid - 15.61$         All No Bid - No Bid - 29.99$         S-XL

Navy Heavy Jacket W/ Removable Liner SPIEWAK S3609 1 86.99$         Sm-4XLg No Bid - 75.63$         All No Bid - No Bid - 104.99$      S-XL

Rain Coat, Long Black/Lime Reversible - High-Viz Neese 4703RSC3M 1 89.99$         Sm-2XLg No Bid - 81.98$         All No Bid - 72.87$         SM-XXL 122.99$      S-2X

Rain Coat, Long Yellow - 1600 Series Economy Neese 1650C 1 21.99$         Sm-3XLg No Bid - 9.54$           All No Bid - 7.02$           SM-XXL 9.25$           S-2X

Rain Boots - Buffalo 16" Steel Toe with Lug Outsole

OnGuard 

Industries 87801 1 N/A - No Bid - 14.07$         All No Bid - No Bid - No Bid -

Traffic Vest, Lime/Navy OccuLux LUX-PSP 1 N/A - No Bid - 21.00$         All No Bid - No Bid - 31.65$         S/M-3X/4X

Traffic Vest, Yellow/Orange-High-Vis Classic Mesh 

Expandable Vest OccuNomix LUX-SC2TB 1 N/A - No Bid - 17.67$         All No Bid - No Bid - 31.65$         S/M-3X/4X

Cycling Pants - Waterproof Olympic OCP588 1 N/A - No Bid - 120.00$      All No Bid - No Bid - 157.00$      S-3X

Cycling Shorts - Phoenix Olympic OCPS168 1 N/A - No Bid - 56.34$         All No Bid - No Bid - 98.00$         S-3X

Orange Ball Cap - 6 panel mesh with sandwich bill 

cap, adj closure Nissun 6PMS 1 N/A - No Bid - 18.60$         All No Bid - No Bid - 9.99$           -

Navy, Plain Ball Cap - Yupoong-100% Brushed Cotton 

w/Velcro Closure The Classics 6363V 1 N/A - No Bid - 4.80$           All No Bid - No Bid - 11.99$         -

Navy Ball Cap-Pro-Model shape-M2 Performance 

Fabric, velcro closure

Pacific 

Headwear 298M 1 20.99$         - No Bid - 6.47$           All No Bid - No Bid - 16.99$         -

Class A Unfiorms Intended Awardee

Class B Uniforms Low Bid item

Class C Uniforms

Patrick's Uniforms of Florida-

Tampa, FL

Allway's McCafferty's 

Uniforms, Inc. - St. 

Petersburg, FL

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.-

Tampa, FL
Galls, LLC-Lexington, KY

GT Distributors, Inc.-

Austin, TX

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, 

Inc.-Vero Beach, FL
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Invitation to Bid #56-16, Police Clothing and Equipment

Bid Tabulation

EQUIPMENT

Description Brand Style # Qty Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size Price Size

Asp Holder - Sidebreak 26 in Black ASP, Inc. 52632 1 40.99$         - 30.50$         - 36.48$         - 30.68$         - 32.59$         - 47.99$         -

Nylon Web Oc Holder-Chemical agent pouch, med, 

black Blackhawk 44A500bk 1 21.99$         - 14.92$         - 15.55$         - 13.94$         - 12.88$         - 24.35$         -

Leather Duty Gunbelt-Plain Leather 2 Row Stiched 2-

1/4" in black Dutyman 1011U 1 45.99$         28-44 39.40$         - 40.14$         - 39.03$         - 35.61$         - 49.99$         30-44

Double Mag Case-Plain Leather Double Mag Holder Dutyman 8511MH 1 23.99$         - 17.89$         - 19.74$         - 16.82$         - 19.67$         - 25.00$         -

Handcuff Case-Plain Leather Standard Single Cuff 

Case in black Dutyman 8811H 1 22.99$         - 15.32$         - 17.55$         - 14.55$         - 16.70$         - 23.30$         -

OC Holder-Chemical agent pouch, plain black leather, 

hidden snap Dutyman 882HS 1 18.99$         - No Bid - 17.94$         - 15.28$         - 15.55$         - 21.99$         -

Duty Belt Keepers-Plain Leather, 3/4", in black Dutyman 2411U 1 4.99$           - 2.84$           - 2.87$           - 2.44$           - 3.76$           - 3.75$           -

Glove Pouch-Plain black leather, hook and loop 

closure Dutyman 3411 1 16.99$         - 11.33$         - 13.80$         - 11.76$         - 12.37$         - 17.50$         -

Black Polyester Canvas Equipment Bag-zippered bag 

with outside zip pocket, 24"x11"x12" Gall's BG186 1 No Bid - 17.00$         - 12.00$         - No Bid - No Bid - 23.00$         -

Badge/Id Holder, Neck Chain-Black leather w/badge 

cut out for B3301, and 2.75" x 3.63" ID holder Perfect fit 706-1 1 16.99$         - 11.50$         - 12.07$         - No Bid - 13.98$         - 16.25$         -

Holster-ALS®/SLS Mid-Ride, Level III Retention™ Duty 

Holster-plain black, right and left hand Safariland

6360-2192-

131-SH 1 126.99$      - No Bid - No Bid - 107.22$      - No Bid - 161.00$      -

Nylon Web Radio Holder-8-1/3" X  4" Molded 

universal radio holder Tru-Spec 9041 1 11.99$         - 10.90$         - 7.86$           - No Bid - 10.25$         - 29.99$         -

Nylon Web Duty Belt-2 inch nylon web belt Uncle Mikes 88721 1 21.99$         - 12.80$         - 44.66$         - 15.49$         - 16.31$         - 27.25$         -

Nylon Web Handcuff Case-Single cuff case w/ flap Uncle Mikes 88781 1 16.99$         - 9.93$           - 11.93$         - 17.06$         - 10.90$         - 17.90$         -

Nylon Web Mag Case-Double magazine holder Uncle Mikes 88367 1 27.99$         - 18.07$         - 20.65$         - 17.59$         - 19.75$         - 30.90$         -

Nylon Web Keepers-for 2-¼" belt, double black snaps Uncle Mikes 88652 1 12.99$         - 7.53$           - 9.00$           - 7.33$           - 9.27$           - 12.90$         -

Flag Pin -¾” enamel, USA Stars and Stripes Flag, with 

Gold Border and Tie Tack Backing 1 2.99$           - No Bid - 2.00$           - No Bid - 6.90$           - 4.75$           -

Intended Awardee

Low Bid item

Patrick's Uniforms of Florida-

Tampa, FL

Allway's McCafferty's 

Uniforms, Inc. - St. 

Petersburg, FL

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.-

Tampa, FL
Galls, LLC-Lexington, KY

GT Distributors, Inc.-

Austin, TX

Lawmens & Shooters Supply, 

Inc.-Vero Beach, FL
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